



**RFP - HVAC Preventative Maintenance
06/14/2019 @ 2:00 pm
AS READ**

**RFB # 19010
Cliff Ruemmler**

Bidder Name	April/May	October	Total Costs
Cahill Heating & Air Conditioning	\$ 13,200.00	\$ 17,280.00	\$ 30,480.00
Climatemp Service Group	\$ 10,404.00	\$ 17,236.00	\$ 27,640.00
Core Mechanical, Inc.	\$ 2,325.00	\$ 2,575.00	\$ 4,900.00
Edwards Engineering, Inc.	\$ 14,854.00	\$ 18,027.00	\$ 32,881.00
F.E. Moran	No bid received	No bid received	No bid received
GT Mechanical, Inc.	\$ 14,625.00	\$ 23,000.00	\$ 37,625.00
Hayes Mechanical	No bid received	No bid received	No bid received
Muzik Mechanical	\$ 4,360.00	\$ 10,790.00	\$ 15,150.00
Northern Weathermakers HVAC	\$ 13,285.00	\$ 15,372.50	\$ 28,657.50
RMC Mechanical	No bid received	No bid received	No bid received
S&S Heating and Cooling	No bid received	No bid received	No bid received
The Hill Group	\$ 16,910.00	\$ 25,396.00	\$ 42,306.00
The YMI Group	\$ 10,425.00	\$ 14,915.00	\$ 25,340.00